Members of the public wishing to speak during Public Comment or on
Items of Business must register with the County Clerk prior to the
beginning of the meeting.

AGENDA

BOARD OF FRANKLIN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
Wednesday, March 23, 2016 | 8:30 a.m.

TO BE HELD IN THE ANNEX COMMISSION CHAMBERS

A. CALL TO ORDER

B. ROLL CALL:
[ Waymire [] Howard [] Dunn [] Harris [] Renoud

C. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE
D. INVOCATION:

1. Invocation Led By Pastor Kim Wilcox, North Baptist Church, Ottawa.
E. CORRESPONDENCE & ORGANIZATIONAL BUSINESS

F. PUBLIC COMMENT:
A citizen desiring to speak on an item not on the agenda may do so at this
time. Discussion is limited to five minutes and the Commission will not
take action or discuss items at this time. Discussion should be limited to
matters of County Commission business and public comment is not
permitted in regard to personnel matters or on pending legal matters.
Items introduced under 'Public Comment' may become agenda items at
a later date.

G. CONSENT AGENDA:
Items listed on the 'Consent Agenda' are considered routine and shall be
enacted by one motion of the Board of Commissioners with no separate
discussion. If separate discussion is desired by a member of the
Governing Body, that item may be removed from the 'Consent Agenda'’
and placed on the regular agenda 'ltems of Business.'

1. Consider And Approve Franklin County Minutes For March 16, 2016 And
Study Session Minutes For March 21, 2016.

2. Consider And Approve Claim Vouchers And Tax Change Orders.
H. ITEMS OF BUSINESS:

1. Receive Update On Lake Region Resource Conservation And



Developmént (RC&D). Don Stottlemire, Lake Region RC&D President.

2. Discussion Of Provision Of Convention, Tourism And Promotion Services
For Franklin County. Jon Holmes, County Administrator

Documents:
20160323 ~ tourism and promotion activities for franklin county - rfp.pdf

3. Discuss And Approve January 2016 EMS Report. Nick Robbins, EMS
Director

Documents:

agenda cover sheet for january 2016 activity report.pdf
january activity report 2016.pdf

4. Discuss And Approve February 2016 EMS Report. Nick Robbins, EMS
Director

Documents:

2016 0323 february 2016 activity report.pdf
february activity report 2016.pdf

5. Consider Approving Soliciting Bids For Tires. James M. Haag Jr., Public
Works Director

Documents:

2016 0323 motion solicitating bids for tires.pdf
tire bid request form summary 2016.pdf

6. Consider Awarding Chemical Bids 1, 4,5 & 7 To CPS And Chemical
Bids 2, 3 & 6 To Van Diest. James M. Haag, Jr., Public Works Director

Documents:

2016 0323 award chemical bids.pdf
chemical bids.pdf

7. Consider Approving A Resolution Installing Stop Signs For Eastbound
And Westbound Traffic On Sand Creek Road At Arkansas Road. James
M. Haag, Jr., Public Works Director

Documents:

2016 0323 stop sign sand crk arkansas rds.pdf
res stop sign sand creek and arkansas.pdf

. STAFF REPORTS
J. COMMISSIONER COMMENTS AND BOARD REPORTS
K. CONSIDER A MOTION FOR ADJOURNMENT



L. INFORMATION AND ANNOUNCEMENTS:

1. UpComing Events
o Commission Meeting on March 30, 2016 at 8:30 A.M.
o Commission Study Session on April 4, 2016 at 8:30 A.M.
o Commission Meeting on April 6, 2016 at 8:30 A.M.
o Commission Meeting on April 13, 2016 at 8:30 A.M.
o Management Luncheon on April 13, 2016 in the Commission
Chambers at Noon.
o SEK Regional Meeting on April 14, 2016.
o Commission Study Session on April 18, 2016 at 8:30 A.M.
o Commission Meeting on April 20, 2016 at 8:30 A.M.
« Joint City/County/School Board Luncheon on April 20, 2016 at USD
290 at Noon.
o Commission Meeting on April 27, 2016 at 8:30 A.M.


http://www.franklincoks.org/d443ac5e-0e39-4866-9691-349272d6e59c
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Agenda Cover Sheet
COUNTY
To: Franklin County Board of County Commissioners
From: Jon Holmes, Administrator
Department: Administration
Date: 3/21/2016

AGENDA ITEM NARRATIVE
Discussion of provision of Convention, Tourism and Promotion services for Franklin
County.

BACKGROUND

The Commissioners have discussed the possibility of issuing a Request for Proposals for
Tourism and Promotional services in Franklin County.

SPECIFIC ACTION REQUESTED

Discussion and provide direction for staff.

ATTACHMENTS
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Agenda Cover Sheet FRANKLIN

COUNTY
KANSAS

To: Franklin County Board of County Commissioners
From: Nick Robbins
Department: Emergency Medical Services
Date: 03/23/2016

AGENDA ITEM NARRATIVE
January 2016 EMS activity report

BACKGROUND
January 2016 EMS activity report

SPECIFIC ACTION REQUESTED
Approval of the January 2016 EMS activity report

ATTACHMENTS
January 2016 EMS activity report



January Activity Report
2016

Prepared by:
Nick Robbins
EMS Chief



Call Volume For the Month
Average Calls Per Day
Calls Year to Date

2015 Calls for Month

2015 Calls / Day average.
2015 Year to Date Calls

Private Pay

General Insurance

Auto Insurance

BCBS of KS

Medicare

Medicaid

Work Comp.

VA Payment

Collections KS Set off
CEU & CPR
Reim. Exp
MidWwWest/Other

Total Deposits for month
Budget per month

Per month + or-

Year to date Deposits
Yearly Budget amount
Year to Date + or -

Medicare Adjustment
Medicaid Adjustment
General Insurance

W/O- Deceased-No Estate
State Collection Fee
MidWest Collection Fee
Small Balance

Owver Charge-Credit

Write off

Totals

January

2016 Ambulance Report

241
7.77
241
267
8.61
267

January 2016 Deposit

$3,363.
$9,256.
$2,607.
$10,848.
$38,212.
$4,204.
$567.
$1,048.
$223.
$1,106.
$0.

$52.

$71,491.
$66,666.
$4,825.
$71,491.
$800,000.
($728,508.

4.71%0
12.95%0

3.65%0
15.07%0
53.45%0
.98%0
.79%0
.A47%0
.31%0
.55%0
.00%0
.0O7%0

45
58
66
65
27
75
90
89
25
(o]0}
oo
50

OOrROROW

20
67
23
20
00
10)

Total percent 100.00%06

January 2016 Adjustments

$22,651
$15,438
$3,444.

$286.
$64.
$22.
$23.
$20.
$814.
$42,765.

Total Income for Month

Total Write off For Month

Total To State Set Off

Total To MidWwest Collection

A7
.94
17

o5
61
50
83
(o]}
64
o1

52.97%0
36.10%06
8.05%0
0.672%06
0.15%0
0.05%%0
0.06%0
0.05%%06
1.90%0

Total percent 100.00%%6

$71.,491.90
$42,765.91
$16,708.15

$480.80

Total Billed for Month

Ambulance Move-up's

$130,604.60

21
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Fire district Percentage
January 2013-2016

60.00%
50.00%
40.00%
20.00%
20.00%
10.00%
0.00% — -__- — h__d_ ___h__-____
South Ottawa North Ottawa Centropols Pottawat omie Pomona Chio Cutler Richmond Wellsville ‘Williamsburg LOH Out of County
W 2016 49.79% 17.84% 0.83% 124% 5.81% 124% 124% 2.07% 7.47% 2.49% 7.88% 2.07%
m 2015 54.68% 22.47% 0.75% 0.75% 4.87% 037% 112% 3.75% 5.99% 262% 150% 112%
= 2014 52.27% 16.20% 114% 1.80% 492% 114% 3.03% 1.80% 9.85% 2.65% 455% 0.38%
m 2013 19.21% 22.83% 157% 0.79% 3.51% 0.79% 157% 5.91% 2.66% 197% 2.36% 0.79%
2013-2016 January
Fire district calls/Day
5.00
4.50
4.00
3.50
3.00
2.50
2.00
1.50
1.00
0.50 I
0.00 -—_- - e
South Ottawa North Ottawa Centropols Pottawat omie Pomona Chio Cutler Richmond Wellsville ‘Williamsburg LOH Out of County
m 2016 3.87 139 006 010 045 010 010 016 058 019 06l 016
m 2015 471 194 006 006 04z 003 010 032 052 023 013 010
w2014 445 139 010 016 04z 010 026 016 084 023 039 003
m 2013 4.03 187 013 006 029 006 013 048 071 016 019 006




January 2016 Data

Hospital Nursing Home Suport Agencies Refusal or Stand-hy
Anderson County 2 | 010% | MeadowBrook Rehab. | 0 [ 0.00% Life Star 0 0.00% CPR Card 1 | 1.56%
Shawnee Mission Medical | 0 | 0.00% | Baldwin Care Center 0 | 0.00% Life Team 0| 0.00% Refuse Medical 19 | 29.69%
St. Lukes South 3] 0.14% Vintage Park 0 | 0.00% Franklin County EMS 5|100.00% Fire Stand-by 4 | 6.25%
St. Lukes Plaza 2 | 0.10% Residence 2 |100.00% CPR Class 2 | 3.13%
St. Francis Hospital 0 | 0.00% | Ottawa RetirementVillage| 0 | 0.00% MVA No Transport 9 | 14.06%
Stormont Vail Hospital 0 | 0.00% Wellsville Manor 0 | 0.00% Public Relations 0 | 0.00%
VAHospital 0 | 000% | RichmondHealthCare | 0 | 0.00% No Patient 0 | 0.00%
Childrens Mercy South 1 | 0.05% | Ottawa RetirementPlaza | 0 | 0.00% Diabetic Treatno transport| 1 | 1.56%
St. Joseph Hospital 0 | 000% | SelectHospital of KC 0 | 0.00% Lift Assist No transport | 11 | 17.19%
Childrens Mercy Hospital 1 | 0.05% Dr. Office 0 | 0.00% Stand-by 2 | 3.13%
Overland Park Regional 3 | 014% | Christian CareCottage | 0 | 0.00% Blood Draw 2 | 3.13%
University ofKansas Med. 2 | 0.10% Deceased no transport | 4 | 6.25%
Lawrence Memorial Hosp. 2 | 0.10% Special Charges 2 | 3.13%
Miami County Medical 1 ] 0.05% No Transport 1 | 1.56%
Menorah Medical Center 0 [ 0.00% Cancelled Enroute 0 | 0.00%
Olathe Medical Center 39 | 1.87% False Medical Alarm 4 | 6.25%
St. Johns 0 | 0.00% Community Homevisit | 2 | 3.13%
Ransom Memorial Hosp. | 113 | 5.43%
Research Medical Ctr. 1 | 0.05%
St. Lukes North 0 [ 0.00%
Total and Percentage 170 | 8.17% 2 1100.00% 100.00% 64 (100.00%
Total Responses 241 Total Refusals 40 | 16.60%
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Agenda Cover Sheet FRANKLIN

COUNTY
KANSAS

To: Franklin County Board of County Commissioners
From: Nick Robbins
Department: Emergency Medical Services
Date: 03/23/2016

AGENDA ITEM NARRATIVE
February 2016 EMS activity report

BACKGROUND
February 2016 EMS activity report

SPECIFIC ACTION REQUESTED
Approval of the February2016 EMS activity report

ATTACHMENTS
February 2016 EMS activity report



February Activity Report
2016

Prepared by:
Nick Robbins
EMS Chief



Call Volume For the Month
Average Calls Per Day
Calls Year to Date

2015 Calls for Month

2015 Calls / Day average.
2015 Year to Date Calls

Private Pay

General Insurance

Auto Insurance

BCBS of KS

Medicare

Medicaid

Work Comp.

VA Payment

Collections KS Set off
CEU & CPR
Reim. Exp
MidWwest/Other

Total Deposits for month
Budget per month

Per month + or-

Year to date Deposits
Yearly Budget amount
Year to Date + or -

Medicare Adjustment
Medicaid Adjustment
General Insurance

W/O- Deceased-No Estate
State Collection Fee
MidWest Collection Fee
Small Balance

Over Charge-Credit

Write off

Totals

Total Income for Month

February 2016 Ambulance Report

February 2016 Deposit

$7,532.18
$8,973.12
$3,911.80
$14,963.67
$28,483.08
$7,351.56
$2,536.28
$0.00
$3,208.00
$497.00
$360.00
$225.12

$78,041.81
$66,666.67
$11,375.14
$149,533.71
$800,000.00
($650,466.29)

Total

February 2016 Adjustments

$17,062.86
$25,538.96
$3,491.29
$0.00
$752.81
$96.47
$41.55
$0.00
$614.92
$47,598.86

Total Write off For Month

$78.041.

$47.598.

Total To State Set Off

$13,899.

Total To MidWest Collection

$4.671.

Total Billed for Month

$163.027.

AmMmbulance Move-up's

Total

286
9.86
527
244
8.71
511

percent

percent

9.65%0
11.502%0

5.01%%6
19.18%0
36.50%0
.42%0
.25%0
.0O0%0
.11%0
.642%0
. 4620
.28%0

C00AOWO

100.00%2%0

35.85%0
.65%0
3320
.00%0
5820
.20%0
.09%0
.0O0%0
.30%0
100.00%2%0

0
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Activities / Fire District
February 2015/2016
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February 2015/2016
250
200 — 1
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0 - I_- |_h s —
Medical . Blood CPR-F.A. Office Public Home
Emerg. Sick Calls MVA Transfers | Stand By Draw Classes Charges | Relations visits
m2016 205 10 22 33 1 0 9 5 0 1
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2013-2016 February
Township Call/Day

6.00
5.00
4.00
3.00
2.00
1.00
000 N | e - S el e |
South Ottawa North Cttawa Centropols Pottawatomie Pomona Chio Cutler Richmond Wellsville ‘Williamsburg LOH Out of County
@2016 538 176 000 007 a7z 010 017 010 0.86 024 031 014
m2015 as7 136 007 004 036 011 043 029 064 018 0465 021
=2014 368 111 004 007 046 0.00 036 036 068 025 021 007
w2013 411 114 014 007 018 007 007 036 054 036 043 007
2013-2016 February
Percentage/Day
60.00%
50.00%
40.00%
30.00%
20.00%
10.00%
oo - Bl o oom B o m mE .
South Ottawa | North Ottawa| Centropolis otta:ratoml Pomona Ohio Cutler Richmond Wellsville | Williamsburg LOH Out of County|
m 2016 54.55% 17.83% 0.00% 0.70% 7.34% 1.05% 1.75% 1.05% 8.74% 2.45% 3.15% 1.40%
m 2015 52.46% 15.57% 0.82% 0.41% 4.10% 1.23% 4.92% 3.28% 7.38% 2.05% 5.33% 2.46%
w2014 50.49% 15.20% 0.49% 0.98% 6.37% 0.00% 4.90% 4.90% 9.31% 3.43% 2.94% 0.98%
m 2013 54.50% 15.17% 1.90% 0.95% 2.37% 0.95% 0.95% 4.74% 7.11% 4.74% 5.69% 0.95%




February 2016 Data

Hospital Nursing Home Suport Agencies Refusal or Stand-by
Anderson County 0 | 000% MeadowBrookRehab. | 0 | 0.00%|LifeStar 0] 0.00% CPR Card 2 | 2.99%
Shawnee Mission Medical | 2 | 0.96% Baldwin Care Center 0 | 0.00%]Life Team 0| 0.00% Refuse Medical 25 | 3731%
St. Lukes South 1| 048% Vintage Park 0 | 0.00%|Franklin County EMS 91 100.00% Fire Stand-by 1| 149%
St. Lukes Plaza 0 | 0.00% Residence 1 1100.00% CPR Class 0 | 000%
St. Francis Hospital 0 | 0.00%| Ottawa Retirement Village| 0 | 0.00% MVA No Transport 15 | 22.39%
Stormont Vail Hospital | 0 | 0.00%  Wellsville Manor 0 | 0.00% Public Relations 0 | 0.00%
VA Hospital 0 | 000% RichmondHealthCare | 0 | 0.00% No Patient 2 | 2.99%
Childrens Mercy South | 0 | 0.00%| Ottawa RetirementPlaza | 0 | 0.00% Diabetic Treatno transport| 2 | 2.99%
St. Joseph Hospital 0 | 0.00% SelectHospital of KC 0 | 0.00% Lift Assist No transport | 10 | 14.93%
Childrens Mercy Hospital | 5 | 2.39% Dr. Office 0 | 0.00% Stand-by 0 | 0.00%
Overland Park Regional | 5 2.39%| Christian Care Cottage | 0 | 0.00% Blood Draw 0 | 0.00%
University of Kansas Med. | 5 | 2.39%| Pioneer Ridge Retirement [ 0 | 0.00% Deceased notransport | 2 | 2.99%
Lawrence Memorial Hosp.| 1 | 0.48% Special Charges 2 | 2.99%
Miami County Medical | 0 | 0.00% No Transport 0 | 0.00%
Menorah Medical Center | 0 | 0.00% Cancelled Enroute 1| 149%
Olathe Medical Center | 55 | 26.32% False Medical Alarm 4 | 597%
St. Johns 1 0.48% Community Home visit 1 1.49%
Ransom Memorial Hosp. | 134 | 64.11%
Research Medical Ctr. | 0 | 0.00%
St. Lukes North 0 | 0.00%
Total and Percentage 209(100.00% 1{100.00% 91100.00% 67/ 100.00%
Total Responses 286 Total Refusals 52| 18.18%
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COUNTY
To: Franklin County Board of County Commissioners
From: James M. Haag, Jr.
Department: Public Works
Date: Wednesday, March 23, 2016

AGENDA ITEM NARRATIVE
Consider approving soliciting bids for tires

BACKGROUND
The Department needs to replenish our stock of tires according to the attached bid sheet

SPECIFIC ACTION REQUESTED

Motion approving soliciting bids for tires

ATTACHMENTS
Bid Form



TIRE BID REQUEST FORM
NO SUBSTITUTIONS

IMMEDIATE
DELIVERY SIZE BRAND DESCRIPTION PRICE/TIRE TOTAL
BID 1
COUNTY NUMBER
18.00 4 11L15 DEESTONE 12 PLY INDUSTRIAL RIB
GRAND TOTAL - DEESTONE
BID 2
COUNTY NUMBER
31.20 3 235/85R16 BRIDGESTONE 10 PLY DURAVIS R250
40.20 2 11R22.5 BRIDGESTONE R-250 ED 16 PLY
51.10 2 225/70/19.5 BRIDGESTONE R-250 14 PLY
58.30 6 285/75R/24.5 BRIDGESTONE R-268 14 PLY
GRAND TOTAL - BRIDGESTONE
BID 3
COUNTY NUMBER
14.20 4 18.4-30 FIRESTONE 8 OR 16 PLY
34.00 18.4-34 FIRESTONE 8 PLY SAT Il
40.30 10 11R22.5 FIRESTONE 16 PLY FD663
55.10 24 11R24.5 FIRESTONE 16 PLY FD663
66.20 4 265/75R24.5 FIRESTONE 10 PLY DESTINATION MT
GRAND TOTAL - FIRESTONE
BID 4
COUNTY NUMBER
39.00 2 255/70R22.5 LINGLONG 16 PLY T810
GRAND TOTAL - LINGLONG
BID 5
COUNTY NUMBER
45.00 10 14.00 X 24 UNICURE CG2 CAP & CASING

GRAND TOTAL - UNICURE

BIDS WILL BE AWARDED TO LOWEST BIDDER NO SUBSTITUTIONS WILL BE ACCEPTED

GRAND TOTAL ALL TIRES

VENDOR NAME

VENDOR ADDRESS
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COUNTY
To: Franklin County Board of County Commissioners
From: James M. Haag, Jr.
Department: Public Works
Date: Wednesday, March 23, 2016

AGENDA ITEM NARRATIVE
Consider awarding chemical bids 1, 4, 5 & 7 to CPS and chemical bids 2, 3 & 6 to Van
Diest

BACKGROUND

The Board of County Commissioners approved solicitation of chemical bids for Noxious
Weed at their February 17, 2016 meeting. Bids were opened on March 17, 2016 at 1:00

P.M. in the office of the County Clerk.

SPECIFIC ACTION REQUESTED
Motion awarding chemical bids 1, 4, 5 & 7 to CPS and chemical bids 2, 3 & 6 to Van Diest

ATTACHMENTS
Bid Tab



2016 Chemical Bid Summary

VENDOR Bid #1 Bid#2 Bid #3 Bid #4 Bid #5 Bid #6 Bid#7
2,4DAmine 24D LV Tordon 22K Pasturegard HL Glyphosate Surfactant Escort XP
1280 gal 720 gal 270 gal 360 gal 360 gal 250 gal 1G/250 gal 2.5G 1280 oz
Van Diest $9.82 $14.09/ $45.89 $96.09 $9.21 8.37 1G/8.11 2.5G $2.67
Totals $12,569.60 $10,144.80 '$12,390.30 $34,592.40 $3,315.60 12092.50 19/2027.5 2.5 $3,417.60
CPS $9.79) $14.89 $45.99 $87.99 $8.94 8.75 1G & 2.5G $2.58
Totals $12,531.20 $10,720.80 $12,417.30 $31,676.40) $3,218.40 $2187.50 each $3,302.40
Helena Chemical $27.00 $15.05 $50.63 $88.76 $11.22 $17.90 1G & 2.5G $2.68
Totals $17,280.00 $10,836.00 $13,670.10 $31,953.60 $4,039.20 $4475.00 each $3,430.40
Ottawa CO-OP $11.28 $15.66 $57.20 $99.88 $10.70 No Bid $12.03
Totals $14,438.40 $11,275.20 $15,444.00 $35,956.80 $3,852.00 No Bid $15,398.40
Red River $11.00 $16.00 $58.00 $103.90 $10.80 8.48 1G/8.48 2.5G $3.60
Totals $14,080.00 $11,520.00 $15,660.00 $37,404.00 $3,888.00 $2120.00/$2120.00 $4,608.00
First Rate Ag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Totals No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
GFG Ag Services $12.82 $16.37 $60.15 $101.17 $11.35 23.22 1G/22.14 2.5G $10.74
Totals $16,409.00 $11,786.00 $16,240.00 $36,421.00 $4,086.00 $5805.00/$5535.00 $13,747.00

BidSummarySht16
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COUNTY
To: Franklin County Board of County Commissioners
From: James M. Haag, Jr.
Department: Public Works
Date: Wednesday, March 23, 2016

AGENDA ITEM NARRATIVE

Consider approving a Resolution installing stop signs for eastbound and westbound traffic
on Sand Creek Road at Arkansas Road

BACKGROUND

The Department was requested to study the intersection of Sand Creek Road and
Arkansas Road to see if stop signs for eastbound and westbound Sand Creek Road was
warranted. The trees in the northeast and northwest quadrants of the intersection
restricts the view of oncoming traffic and it is recommended to install stop signs for
eastbound and westbound traffic on Sand Creek Road at Arkansas Road.

SPECIFIC ACTION REQUESTED

Motion approving a Resolution installing stop signs for eastbound and westbound traffic on
Sand Creek Road at Arkansas Road

ATTACHMENTS



BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
OF
FRANKLIN COUNTY, KANSAS

RESOLUTION NO. RESOLUTION NO. 16-

WHEREAS, the intersection of Sand Creek Road with Arkansas Road in rural Franklin County, Kansas, is formed
by the convergence of a minor east-west road viz. Sand Creek Road, and a minor north-south road, viz. Arkansas Road; and

WHEREAS, K.S.A. 8-2002, authorizes local authorities, including counties, to designate any highway as a through
highway or designate any intersection or junction of roadways as a stop or yield intersection or junction, and

WHEREAS, K.S.A. 8-2008, authorizes local authorities to erect and maintain stop signs, yield signs, or other
official traffic-control devices upon highways under their jurisdictions; and

WHEREAS, pursuant to K.S.A. 8-2003, Section 2B-5, Number 1, of the Manual of Uniform Traffic Control
Devices, provides for the placement of a stop sign where the application of the normal right-of-way is unduly hazardous; and

IT IS THEREFORE recommended that stop signs for eastbound and westbound traffic on Sand Creek Road be
installed at the intersection of Sand Creek Road and Arkansas Road.

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
OF
FRANKLIN COUNTY, KANSAS

THAT the Board of County Commissioners hereby directs that a stop signs for eastbound and westbound traffic on
Sand Creek Road be installed at the intersection of Sand Creek Road and Arkansas Road.

This resolution shall be in full force and effect following its adoption and publication in the official county
newspaper, and the actual installation of the described stop signs.

Passed and adopted in regular session, this 23t day of February, 2016.

Richard A. Howard, Chairman

Attested and Recorded this 23t day of February, 2016.

Janet Paddock, Franklin County Clerk





